
In what year was Django first publicly 
released? 
 
Which newspaper’s developers originally 
created Django? 
 
Which large social network famously 
used Django in its early days? 
 
What’s the slogan of Django that 
reflects its speed of development? 
 
What’s the default database engine 
configured in a new Django project? 
 
Who were the original lead developers 
of Django? 
 
Django was originally built to power 
which type of site? 



 
Django’s first public release version was 
numbered what? 
 
Which design pattern does Django’s 
architecture follow? 
 
What’s Django’s equivalent of the MVC 
“Controller”? 
 
Which middleware handles clickjacking 
protection? 
 
Which Django setting should always be 
False in production for security? 
 
Before Django supported database 
migrations, how did developers modify 
models? 
 



When was the Django Software 
Foundation (DSF) launched? 
 
What was the very first Django project 
you ever built? 
 
Which Django feature could you not live 
without? 
Have you ever named a Django app 
something silly? What was it? 
 
What’s your favorite Django command 
to type? 
 
Have you ever broken a Django project 
right before a deadline? What 
happened? 
 
If you could magically add one feature 
to Django overnight, what would it be? 



 
What’s the weirdest bug you’ve ever 
encountered in a Django project? 
 
Have you ever used Django for 
something totally unrelated to web 
development? 
 
Which Django setting have you 
forgotten to change in production (and 
regretted)? 
 
What’s your favorite third-party Django 
package? 
 
Which part of Django’s admin do you 
secretly wish looked cooler? 
 
Have you ever left the Django debug 
toolbar running on a live site? 



What’s the funniest variable name 
you’ve seen in a Django project? 
 
If you could meet Django’s creators, 
what’s the first question you’d ask them? 
 
Have you ever convinced someone to 
switch from another framework to 
Django? How? 


